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Lavelua, Jessica

T T S N
From: MyAccount@suburbanpropane.com
Sent: Monday, April 10, 2017 3:14 PM . .
To: Lavelua, Jessica SAP Vendor or FID - Certiied Original

invoice Date .  4/10/2017
Invaice/Reference No.  STP BACK UP GENERATOR

Total Amount of invoice: $155,13

1039500000-3828311001 -mmmM@m// \&Aﬁ 5513 2016
Received-Correct-Approved
PURGHASE MADE IN ACCORDANGE WITH COM Ebzcwga .3 AND MGT. DIRECTIVE 310.23 AMENDED [COM

PURCHASING PROGRAM].
038 PROPANE TO RUN m>0 GENERATOR @STP.NO

CONTRACTED VENDOR WAS AVAILABLE TO mmmSOm PGSP

Subject: Confirmation for your recent Subt

Dear Prince Gallitzin Park,

Thank you for your recent Suburban Propane online payment. Your cm<3m3 has been mcoommmE__< muu__mo_ to your Suburban Propane

account 2090-365793. loack w P

Event Date: 04/10/2017 15:13:29
Payment Amount: $155.13 N 7 i e\gmﬂm - wall Gad \ WR .\N\
Payment Method: credit card nﬁw@\ Yi(P ﬁv(bm\u

Payment Reference ID: SPPPAY001790373

If you have questions regarding Suburban Propane's online payment service, please email us at MyAccount@suburbanpropane.com or
call us toll-free at 1-800-776-7263, 8:00am to 7:00pm ET Monday-Friday (except for New Years Day, Memorial Day, [ndependence
Day, Labor Day, Thanksgiving Day and Christmas Day). Please include your Suburban Propane account number in all
correspondence.

We appreciate your business and look forward to continuing to serve your energy needs.
Thank you.

Disclaimer: The information contained in this communication is confidential and privileged proprietary information intended only for the

E./wao:m_ and confidential use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message,
. )
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Lavelua, Jessica

Lo AT T M RN R
From: MyAccount@suburbanpropane.com ‘

Sent: Monday, >9.__ 10, 2017 3:16 PM SAP Vendor or FID : Certified Original

To: Lavelua, Jessica invoice Date :  4/11/2017

Subject: Confirmation for your recent Suburban Propi  Invoice/Reference No,  confi#1790393

Total Amount of invoice:

$208.18
1039500000-3826311001-833210 $208.19 2018
Received-Caorrect-Approved : ﬂ \C(%\f(k/
..‘..CIOI.}mmg.»_um_Z>OODZU>ZOmc<qIOD_<_ %ZETWvoﬁmdm.w >Z_u?_mﬁ..U_Imﬁdz\.mm\_o‘MubEmzchHOOZ

FURCHASING PROGRAM].

038 propane required to run hot water heater at Pavilion 4 restroom. No
cantracted vendor was avaialble to service PGSP.

Dear Prince Gallitzin Park,

Thank you for your recent Suburban Propane online payment. Your payment has been successfully applied to your Suburban Propane
account 2090-365818. -

i eAre o une _J
r Sgﬁ.. wictin  haater a7
Payment Amount: $209.19 %mvoi\_ w TQ\r $

Payment Method: credit card ; e, o
y Zg Contrac Led _\,m\ix? Wi 5
Payment Reference ID: SPPPAY001790393 sl lab le 0 Service mwwﬂ%v

Event Date: 04/10/2017 15:16:18

If you have questions regarding Suburban Propane's online payment service, please email us at MyAccount@suburbanpropane.com or
call us toll-free at 1-800-776-7263, 8:00am to 7:00pm ET Monday-Friday (except for New Years Day, Memorial Day, Independence
Day, Labor Day, Thanksgiving Day and Christmas Day). Please include your Suburban Propane account number in all
correspondence.

We appreciate your business and look forward to continuing to serve your energy needs.
Thank you.

isclaimer: The information contained in this communication is confidential and privileged proprietary information intended only for the

“. parsonal and confidential use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message,

%

% 1
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Lavelua, Jessica 25730
From: MyAccount@suburbanpropane.com
Sent: Maonday, April 10, 2017 3:19 T :
To: Lavelua, Jessica SAP Vendor or FID © Certified Original
Subject: Confirmation for your recent  rveice Date - 4/11/2017
invoice/Reference No.  ocnf#1790412
Total Amount of inveice: $411.07

4()39500000-3828311001-6332100, 7 $411.07 2016

Received-Correct-Approved : o
PLURCHASE MADE IN ACCORDANCE WITH COM g)ngﬁb AND MGT. DIRECTIVE 310.23 AMENDED [COM

PURCHASING PROGRAM). 3
038 Propane to fun back up generaier @ PM residence. No contracted
wvendor was avaialble to service PGSP.

Dear Prince Galiitzin Park,

Thank you for your recent Suburban Propane online payment. Your payment has been successfully applied to your Suburban Propane
account 2080-365777.

Event Date: 04/10/2017 15:19:06 . %Qﬁm\ ,..r - NQQE T _@ﬁ
Payment Amount: $411.07 &M %w\@ %wg.ﬁ _\d\ﬁ.mﬁ.m_\ﬁm, \Z\w
. “ A, —
Payment Method: credit card %\(@ TM\ ‘8 Sg\\r ce
Payment Reference ID: SPPPAY001790412 Ne  contracked vi@ndor woes
avilable o stivice PYSE.

If you have questions regarding Suburban Propane's online payment service, please email us at MyAccount@suburbanproparne.com or
call us toll-free at 1-800-776-7263, 8:00am to 7:00pm ET Monday-Friday (except for New Years Day, Memorial Day, Independence
Day, Labor Day, Thanksgiving Day and Christmas Day). Please include your Suburban Propane account number in all
correspondence.

We appreciate your business and look forward to continuing to serve your energy needs.
Thank you.

Ww_mo_mmamq” The information contained in this communication is confidential and privileged proprietary information intended only for the
personal and confidential use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message,

1
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Lavelua, Jessica _
[
From: MyAccount@suburbanpropane.com
Sent: Monday, April 10, 2017 3:21 PM
To: Lavelua, Jessica SAF Vendor or FID Certified Original
Subject: Confirmation for your recent Subur Invoice Date - 41172017

- Invoice/Reference No.  conf#1790421

Total Amount of invoice: $481.00

1039500000-3826311001-6332100 j $481.00 2016

Received-Correct-Approved | | | A

Hucmnx.bmm_s.)_um_Zhonﬂmu.»znmg"._.:o.ﬂgg}C.PFZN._m.m}zU_SD,_.‘Uﬁmodz\.mw._ohm.»;mzumuTUOZ
PURCHASING PROGRAM]. A

038 Propane to run back up generator @ CG office. No contracted vendor
was avaialble to service PGSP.

e

Dear Prince Gallitzin Park,

Thank you for your recent Suburban Propane online payment. Your payment has been successfully applied to your Suburban Propane
account 2090-365785.

[y

Event Date: 04/10/2017 15:21:07 _ e
v U bak “g

L v ,, -
Payment Amount: $481.00 %“\@ovm: .UT@J\\@ O@ o ‘Tm e

) COWTTECT Q\ VS Smg ~ Wi S ’vad \mﬁ Wmmq
Payment Reference ID: SPPPAY001790421 .T,\M SECLVILE ﬁuu S =

If you have questions regarding Suburban Propane's online payment service, please email us at MyAccount@suburbanpropane.com or
call us toll-free at 1-800-776-7263, 8:00am to 7:00pm ET Monday-Friday (except for New Years Day, Memorial Day, Independence
Day, Labor Day, Thanksgiving Day and Christmas Day). Please include your Suburban Propane account number in all
correspondence.

Payment Method: credit card Z

We appreciate your business and look forward to continuing to serve your energy needs.
Thank you.

‘Disclaimer: The information contained in this communication is confidential and privileged proprietary information intended only for the
rsonal and confidential use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message,

1






. Payment Approval

Page 1 of 1
Al 35€
N;A-%@—Q&-.%AJC yf/%‘

Thank you for your payment.
Please print and retain this infermation for your records.

Your payment will be posted to REA Energy.
Account Number
70001862-001
70001862-002
70001862-003
7000186 2-004

Payment Amount
$113.51

$13.50

$43.92

$44.91

098380
9/27/2017
$215.84

**‘k***k****5386

Confirmation Number
Payment Date

Total Charge Amount
Credit Card Number
Credit Card Name

| Print } [ Close

Jeffery L Layton

This page serves as your seceipt and provides you with a Confirmation Number.

Us gdvv,ﬁ.,

SAP Vendor or FID : 25-0809685
Invoice Date :  9/28/17
Invoice/Reference No.
Total Amount of invoice:
1038500000-3826311001-633230

Certified Original

Sept 2017 electric bills
$215.84
$215.8 2017

Received-Correct-Approved : A /\/{J S S

PURCHASE MADE IN ACCORDANGE WATH CDTJA M215.3 AND MGT. DIRECTSVE 310.23 AMENDED fCOM

FURCHASING FROGRAM).

038 Sept 2017 REA electric bills™.___

hitps://egateway.sedata.com/PaymentGateway/Payment Approval

PAIDstay gy
d"‘/'@

9/27/17






























































































































Payment Approval o . o . 251
| s 25637 page1of1

e

Thank you for your payment.
Thi i
is page serves as your receipt and provides you with a Confirmation Number
Please print and retain this information for your recerds.

Your payment will be posted to REA Energy.
Account Number Payment Amount
70001862-001 $102.78
70001862-002 $13.50
70001862-003 $36.00
70001862-004 $49.65

Confirmation Number 092037
Payment Date 3/14/2017
Total Charge Amount  $201.94
Credit Card Number *#***#3ssr+g744
Credit Card Name Jessica Lavelua

Print Close

Certified Original

BAP Vendoer or FID 25-0809685
invoice Date ! 342017
invoice/Reference No. 2/8/17-3/8/17
‘Tatal Amount of invoice:
1 ($39500000-382631 1 001-6332300-\

F__iece‘wed—Correct-Approved T i
. PURCHASE MADE IN ACCORDANCE WITH GbM MANL

PURCHASING PROGRAM]. \\~
538 payment for February 2017 eléctric usage fo

5.3 AND MGT. DIRECTIVE 210.23 AMENDED [COM

r 4 accounis

https://egateway.sedata.com/PaymentGateway/PaymentApproval 3/14/
2017
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Glassmere Fuel Service Inc.

L ]
R e C e I p't 1967 Saxonburg Blvd, Tarentum, Pennsylvania 15084

724-265-4646

Cardholder Name: Bill To Adaress:
Cardholder Phone: . Pennsylvania
Cardhoider Email:

Customer Name:

Transaction Type: Authorize And Capture Transaction Status: Submitted
Created Date: 3/8/2014 3:33:15 PM EST Authorization Date: 3/8/201é 3:33:15 PM EST
Capture Date:  3/8/2014 3:33:16 PM EST : Authorization Code: 094400 -
AVS Address: None AVS Zip: Nane

Name On Card: Robin Duke Card Brand: MC
Card Number:  xxxx-xxxx -xxx-34683 Security Code Status: Provided

Security Code Response: Matched

Customer Ref Value: 574630328 Order Number: 993040, 41, 42

Invoice Number: 993040, 41, 42 Invoice Date: 3/7/2016
Ship From Postal Code: 15084 Shipping Company: None

Tracking Number:

Product Code CMDTY Code

UCM Code
Wvoice. a

Sub-Total: $5,759.90
Sales Tax: £0.00
SAP Vendor or FID : SAP #149947  ME gasoline Certified Original Freight {*mOU”*i $0.00
invoice Date :  3/7M6 Freight Tax: $0.00
invoice/Reference No.  Delivery 3/7/2016 Duly Amount: $0.00
Total Amount of invoice: $5,759.90 Total (USD): $5,759.90
1039500000-3826311001-6380211 $1,922.79 2015
1039500000-3826311001-6380213 $892.31 o f .. 2015
3 /4/?4
1039500000-3826311001 -6@?{)00 $2,944.80 j 2015
Received-Correct-Approved | V€Y - ‘ng—‘

PURCHASE MADE IN ACCORDANGE WITH COM MANUAL M215.3 AND MGT. DIRECTIVE 310.23 AMENDED [COM
PURGCHASING PROGRAM].

038 Delivery 3/7/16 of 1863.8G ($1.58/G) ULS bio-heating oil, 1383.3G
($1.39/G) unleaded gasoline and 561.2G ($1.59/G) ULS bio-diesel fuel for
the state-owned vehicles and equipment used by the staff at Prince
Gallitzin State Park.

Glassmere Fuel Service Inc. uses advanced payment precessing services provided by 3Delta Systems. Inc.® www 3DSl.com.
3/8/2016 3:33:4) PM EST
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{PAGEND. | INVOICE DATE

HSLPENDEHY FRAIRGD HT .~§‘j‘ﬂ -
PACIFIC b 4 X 1l oss0R/14
PRIDE <= e Gasoline » Heating Qil » Diese! Fuel » BIODIESEL AAEROUSET :

Samrmartinl Fusta 7N AREHOUSE|  INVOIGE NO.
LAY PO BOX 167
) CURTISVILLE, PA 15032 i L O0ELDE
ULTFRA 2 www.glassmerefuel.com A It
vl (724) 224-0880 + (724) 265-4645

PREMIUM HEATING DI TOLL FREE - 1-800-235-9054 Ship Datey 0S5/08714

5%; COMMOMWEALTH OF PA-FD Invoice

" COMPTROLLER BFFICE
PO EBDX 462180

ig%ﬁINCE GOLLITZIN STATE FARK
Ghh MARINA KD
CAMBRTA COUNTY

HARRIGEUREG, PA 17104 FATTON, PA 146484317
Acmceﬁpﬁggcﬁnuq?ryes Pjassinere Fuel Sarvice ne. 1o charge a 1.5% finance charge on ali past duo accounts (8% AMNUALLY.) Te avoid FINANCE CHARGE pay all invelos within terms statad below,
.~ PO.NUMBER ACCOUNT NO., SHIF ViA SNES T oL, 7 SHETHS TERMS N

radubkedps.gov| TFAI0EER Db NET &0
Product Code/ Ghipped/ e By ioe
Descyiption Bilied LOM Each Futenston

XX FUEL OIL COMBUSTURLE

X MARINE ENGINES

LIALITD UN 1993PEITT
X DYED LWMARKED HEATING 0OIL: NOT FOR USE
KE IN HIGHWAY, MONROAD AOCOMOTIVE, OR

1 1148.1 &AL
2 LLTRA HEAT HEATING OIL 11481 EAlL L.B7000 2lab .75

The Buyer does hereby empower any atlorney of any court of record of
ihe Commonwealth of Penisylvania to appear for Buyer and {o confess 8
judgement or judgements in favor of Glassmere Fusl Sepvice, their heirs,
5UCcas50rs oF assipgns and aqainst the Buyer in any amount then due and
owing plus interest, attornay's commission of 5% and costs, _

The undersigned hetehy guaranteas and assuras the Sequred Partly that hefshe is-authorized by the Buyer to execute 1his
Sales Agreement on behalf of the Buyer and to purchase the items set {orth hergin:

BUYER HEREBY ACKNOWLEDGES AECEIPT OF THE MERCHANINSE AND SERVICES SET FORTH HEREIN TOGETHER

WITH A COPY OF THIS CONTRACT.
Qg@?ﬁeﬁ

2, A4s, 95




























ALY TR

VS ook
Statement
FRIDAY GAS & OIL COMPANY, INC. Stucke
20185 Bennetts Valley Hwy
PO Box 84 (‘})(\

Byrnedale. PA 15827
1-877-835-5488

ACCOUNT # |
11/16/2017
v
Prince Gallitzin State Park Prince Gallitzin State Park
966 Marina Road E 966 Marina Road
Patton, PA 16668-8317 % Paiton, PA 16668-6317
No Payment Due
L ‘jv‘ Cutfre P!ease Returnﬂs porhon wnh 1 your p payment o Amount EEIosed 5 — .
E .- Invoice #: - Posted Oni. 7 Ref#: - Transactlop: o oo Lo . Comments. - . .. .- .~ ' Amount §
Regular Account Activity
PREVIOUS BALANCE 0.00
122735 11-15-17 07911 GASCLINE-EXEMPT 1150.00@ 2.25 2,687.50
1227386 07912 ULSD ON RCAD-EXEMPT 361.70 @ 2.455 887.97
122737 07913 #2 FUEL OIL 98870 @ 2.085 2,061.44
122739 11-18-17 111517 CREDT CARD 091878 {5,536.91)
Regular Balance: $0.00

SAP Vendor or FID : Certified Original
Invoice Date :  11/20/17
Invoice/Reference Na.  11/15 Fue! delivery

Total Amount of invoice: $5,536.91
1039500000-3826311001-6380211 $2,587.50 2017
1639500000-3826311001-6380213 $887.97 2017
1039500000 3826311001 6360210 i $2,061.44 2017
Received-Comect-Approved : AV‘ Vvt {.’l Adi~

PURCHASE MADE {N ACCORDANCE WITH COM MANJAL M215.3 AND MGT. DIRECTIVE 310, ;I;KT*ENDED [COM
PURCHASING PROGRAM).

J3B PRGA - 11500 Gallons unleaded Gasoline . 361.70 Gallons of On
Road Diesel. And 988.70 gallons of heating oil for PRGA use

[ Total Due: 50.00 |}

1AL PERCENTAGE RATE = 19.56%) will be charged

7 5. Thank you!
FRIDAY Account# 3695-1

1-877-82 Page 1 of 1

























Payment Approval

ALYS 7

Page [ of |

s Bok

Thank you for your payment,
This page serves as your receipt and provides you with a Confirmation Number,
Please print and retain this information for your records.

Your payment will be posted to REA Energy.
Account Number Payment Amount
70001862-001  $103.66
70001862-002 $13.50
70001862-003  $43.48
70001862004 $44.82

Confirmation Number (033276
Payment Date 11/20/2017
Total Charge Amount  $205.46
Credit Card Number ****#*++345385
Credit Card Mame Jeffery L Layton

[prine | [ close |

CPAIDNYZODY

GAF Verdor or FID ;. 25-0809665
Invoice Date :  12/4/17
tnvoice/Reference No.  Nov2017 Electric bills
Total Amount of invoice: $205.46
10395G0000-3826311001-6232300

PURCHASING PPOGRAMI.

Certifiad Criginal

Received-Correct-Approved © _— [
FURCHASE MADE IN ACCORDANCE WITH GOM MANPAL M215.3 AND MGT. [ HCTIVE 210,25 AMENDED [COM
bi;a;

038 PRGA - Nov 2017 REA <2054 Long Rd. marina Rd dock light,

2100 Long Rd, and 1903 Beaver valley Rd.

https://egateway.sedata.com/PaymentGateway/PaymentApproval

11/20/17

;
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-Payment Approval

‘?é('/og Page 1 of 1

LA71I|J.J ug )M/géh

Account Number
70001862-001
70001862-002
70001862-003
70001862-004

Confirmation Number
Payment Date

Total Charge Amount
Credit Card Number
Credit Card Name

Thank you for your payment.
This page serves as your receipt and provides you with a Confirmation Number.

Please print and retain this information for your records.

Your payment will be posted to REA Energy.

Payment Amount
$96.53
$13.50
$42.69
§44.56

032029
10/23/2017
$197.28
***********5386
Jeffery L Layton

[prnt |

[ close |

SAP Vendoror FID : 25-0809685
Invoice Date :  10/23/17

Invoice/Reference No.
Total Amount of invoice:

1039500000-3826311001-6332

- - 3&0 5§97 28/ 2017
Received-Corect-Approved - : "i_ M

PURCHASE MADE ¥ ACCORDANCE WiTH CISM MXNUAL M215.3 AND
PURCHASING PROGIA. MGT. DIRECTIVE 310.23 AMENDED [COM

038 PRGA - electric service for Sept to Oct 2017

Dnc123m

Certified Original

Eiectric bills - Sept to Oct 2017
$197.28

https://egateway.sedata.com/Pay mentGateway/Payment Approval

10/23/17
















